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in the same Harvard Design Magazine issue (Fall 2006/Winter 2007), 
although online only, where some of the essays in this book fi rst ap-
peared. The relative lack of consensus on the value of Bruegmann’s 
empirical analysis for urban design and the implicit threat that it rep-
resents to the urban design discourse as presently constructed are 
evident in the reception of Bruegmann’s work in Harvard Design 
Magazine and available for all to interpret.

Among those threats is the increasingly clear sense that urban de-
sign as described in these pages has largely abandoned its original as-
piration to articulate urban order for the places where most North 
Americans live and work. Given the fact that many European cities 
are increasingly emulating the economic and spatial characteristics of 
North American cities, this is an issue of no small relevance to discus-
sions of urban design internationally, particularly since so much of the 
history of urban design as written here has been focused on the impor-
tation of European models of urbanity into North American cities.

It is in the contexts of urban design’s as yet unrealized promise 
and potential that landscape urbanism has emerged in the past de-
cade. Landscape urbanism has come to stand for an alternative within 
the broad base of urban design historically defi ned. Incorporating 
continuity with the aspirations of an ecologically informed planning 
practice, landscape urbanism has been equally informed by high de-
sign culture, contemporary modes of urban development, and the 
complexity of public- private partnerships. Julia Czerniak’s account 
of landscape architecture’s recent shift of concerns from appearance 
to performance says much about this potential. Equally, her invoca-
tion in these pages of Sébastien Marot’s work is equally deserving 
of mention. Marot has recently formulated a coherent theoretical 
framework to correlate landscape urbanism with contemporary ar-
chitectural culture.5 Marot’s paired theories of “suburbanism” and 
“superurbanism” promise a potential reconciliation of urban design’s 
historical estrangement from architectural culture.

Marot formulated superurbanism to account for contemporary 
architectural culture’s interest in hyperprogrammed architectural in-
terventions as a substitute or surrogate for the traditional mix and 
diversity of urban milieus. He articulated suburbanism to describe an 
essentially landscape urbanist practice of design in the context of de-
creasing density. In between the sub-  and the super- , everyday urban-
ism persists as an irreducible (and ultimately undesignable) subtext of 


